
Geography Vocabulary progression  

 

 

 
KS1  Lower KS2 Upper KS2  

Lets go exploring 
 

Near, far, left, right, ocean, sea, season, 
weather, city, town, village, factory, farm, 
house, office, port, harbour, shop, North, 

South, East, West, England, Scotland, 
Northern Ireland, Wales, North Sea, English 

Channel, Irish Sea, Atlantic Ocean, 
temperature, Africa, Antarctica, Asia, 

Europe, North America, South America, 
Oceania, Antarctic, Arctic, Atlantic, Indian, 

Pacific, pole, map, key, symbol 

Stone age to iron age 
 

Equator, North Hemisphere, South 
Hemisphere, Tropic of Cancer, Tropic of 

Capricorn, biome, vegetation belt, 
settlement, grid reference, river 

Haslingfield Explorers 
 

United Kingdom, England, London, Bristol, 
equator, northern and southern 
hemispheres, Tropics of Cancer/ Capricorn, 
Arctic/ Antarctic Circle, longitude and 
latitude, degrees, climate zones, tropical, 
sub-tropical, temperate, polar, arid, 
Mediterranean, dry-temperate, cold 
temperate, mountains, tundra, time zone, 
Prime/Greenwich Meridian Time (GMT), 
local time, sketch maps, plans, graphs, 
digital technologies, rural, urban, land use  
 

 

 
KS1  Lower KS2  Upper KS2  

Seaside 
 

Beach, cliff, coast, sea, ocean, river, season, 
weather, port, harbour, North Sea, English 

Channel, Irish Sea, Atlantic Ocean 
 
 
 

 

Romans 
 

Europe, Italy (Rome), France (Paris), Spain 
(Madrid), Turkey, South America, Argentina 

(Buenos Aires), Brazil (Sao Paolo, Rio De 
Janeiro), Chile, Colombia, Peru, North 

America, Canada (Ottawa), United States 
of America (Washington), Mexico (Mexico 

City), Central America, Guatemala, 
Honduras, Belize, equator, northern 

Ancient Greece 
 

Human feature, physical feature, region, 
settlement, migration, immigration, 

community, population, government, 
democracy, land use, resources, trade, 

urban, rural, farming, agriculture, facilities, 
architecture, recreation, transport, culture, 
language, religion, landform, ocean, coast, 
river, island, cape, delta, peninsula, gulf, 
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hemisphere, southern hemisphere, climate, 
warm, dry, wet, humid, tepid 

mountain, hill, valley, plateau, plain, desert, 
equator, northern hemisphere, southern 

hemisphere, climate, tropical, subtropical, 
temperate, polar, arid, mediterranean, dry-

temperate, cold temperate, mountains, 
tundra vegetation, biome, aquatic, desert, 

forests, rainforest, forest, woodland, 
grasslands, tundra, villages, towns, cities, 

settlements 
 

 
KS1  Lower KS2  Upper KS2  

Grab your passport 
 

North, South, East, West, England, Scotland, 
Northern Ireland, Wales, North Sea, English 
Channel, Irish Sea, Atlantic Ocean, seasons, 

temperature, Africa, Antarctica, Asia, 
Europe, North America, South America, 

Oceania, Antarctic, Arctic, Atlantic, Indian, 
Pacific, pole, map, key, symbol 

Extreme Earth 
 

Earthquake, volcano, biome, vegetation 
belt, settlement, grid reference, river, water 
cycle, meander, valley, floodplain, tributary, 

stream, erosion, mouth 

Our blue planet 
 

Climate zones, biomes, vegetation belts, 
rivers, mountains, volcanoes, earthquakes, 
water cycle, transpiration, distribution, 
topographical feature, coast, river, island, 
cape, delta, peninsula, gulf, plateau, plain, 
desert, water cycle, evaporation, 
transpiration, condensation, precipitation, 
run-off, river, tidal river, estuary, stream, 
lake, tributary, current, bank, delta, mouth, 
source, fresh water, saltwater, mountain, 
mountain range, tectonic plates, force, 
contour, altitude, elevation, erosion, summit, 
peak, ascent, descent 
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KS1  Lower KS2  Upper KS2  

Castles 
 

Near, far, left, right, , cliff, forest, hill, 
mountain, river, soil, valley, vegetation, 

season, North, South, East, West 

Anglo Saxons 
 

Desert, rainforest, temperate, energy, food, 
minerals, water, river, altitude, biomes, 

climate change, fossil fuels, resources, world 
heritage site 

Word War II 
 

North America, South America, France, 
Spain, Italy, Germany, Russia, Portugal, 
region, latitude, longitude, maps, atlas, 

globe, digital mapping 
 

 

 
 Lower KS2  Upper KS2  
 Ancient Egypt  

 
Egypt, France, Spain, Italy, Germany, Russia, 
Portugal, Equator, North America, South 
America, Ocean, Atlantic, Pacific, Indian, 
continent (including names), capital, North, 
East, South, West, vegetation, globe, 
equator, compass, route, location 

North American Road Trip 

 
Rural, urban, land use, North America, 

South America, coasts, time zones, citizens, 
democracy, human rights, imported, 

interconnected, media, products, services, 
technology 

 
 

 Lower KS2  Upper KS2  
 Out and about the British Isles 

 
North Atlantic Ocean, north-western coast, 
Great Britain, Northern Ireland, the Isle of 

Man, seas, oceans, grid reference, atlas, 
globe, map, compass, ordnance survey 

Word War I 
 

Arial map, ordinance survey maps, google 
map, political map, topographic map, 
physical map, economic/ resource map, 
scale, key, symbols, location, compass, 

direction, bearing, north, south, east, west, 
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northeast (NE), southeast (SE), southwest 
(SW), northwest (NW), grid reference, grid 
box, eastings, northings, equator, northern 

and southern hemispheres, Tropics of 
Cancer/ Capricorn, Arctic/ Antarctic Circle, 

longitude and latitude, degrees, colour 
layering, contour, contour interval, cross 
section height above sea level, distance, 

kilometres (kms) 

 
 

  Upper KS2  
  Invaders and Settlers 

 
Rural, urban, land use, economic, energy, 
food, minerals, water, citizens, democracy, 
human rights, imported, interconnected, 

products, services, technology 

 
 

  Upper KS2  
  South America - Rainforests 

 
South America, rainforest, region, 

biodiversity, canopy, climate change, 
deforestation, emergent layer, forest floor, 
habitat, latitude, longitude, middle layer, 

tributary, tropics , national park, sediment, 
storm, drought 
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